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                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 11/30/12 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF November 20, 2012 
 
CONTRACT R -29047-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9803730                                         DBE GOAL: 12.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT                         ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     676,000.00 
CALL: 190                 ROUTE: SR 5                                                FT. WAYNE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 5 OVER BRANCH OF CLEAR CREEK, 0.7 MILE NORTH OF US 24 
 
                         COUNTY: HUNTINGTON 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE                   | $    599,846.99 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         260-478-1990 |                 |    |   |        DBE  12.01% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC               | ANDERSON                     | $    620,574.86 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-643-5358 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                     | FORT WAYNE                   | $    664,753.82 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         260-478-1548 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1817530  | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC         | ALBION                       | $    673,379.55 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         260-636-3000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2094565  | 3D COMPANY INC                 | MUNCIE                       | $    628,114.88 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-288-3326 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT B -28557-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100462                                         DBE GOAL:  7.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                             ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   1,488,000.00 
CALL: 450                 ROUTE: US 52                                               GREENFIELD DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 52, 5.87 MILES EAST OF SR 3 
 
                         COUNTY: RUSH 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-4305155  | R A MYERS CONSTRUCTION CO      | MUNCIE                       | $  1,904,457.40 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-896-9704 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1128289  | BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC         | BOGGSTOWN                    | $  1,439,775.88 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-835-2254 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1151771  | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC  | WHITESTOWN                   | $  1,753,000.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-769-1900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1357381  | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC      | NORTH VERNON                 | $  1,570,659.01 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-346-4135 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1385672  | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | COLUMBUS                     | $  1,399,536.14 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-372-8441 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1606893  | OLCO INC                       | BATESVILLE                   | $  1,902,174.35 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-934-4574 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1618530  | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE               | $  1,847,520.06 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-280-4404 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $  1,714,746.75 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $  1,340,300.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         812-579-5248 |                 |    |   |        DBE  7.05% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT B -33357-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. N881008                                         DBE GOAL:  7.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT                                  ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  18,324,000.00 
CALL: 494                 ROUTE: 152                                                 LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 152 OVER CSX AND IHB RAILROAD, AT 0.4 MILE NORTH OF 
                                 SUMMER STREET 
                         COUNTY: LAKE 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID   TYPE   LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             |$     127,629.83 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 ROAD REPLACEMENT PCCP      |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             |$     190,806.41 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 ROAD REPLACEMENT HMA       |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
27-0887958  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC       | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  |$   6,746,770.51 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
27-0887958  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC       | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  |$  10,815,651.31 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BULB-T  | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
27-0887958  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC       | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 BR REPL WELDED PLATE GIRDER| IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
27-0887958  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC       | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 ROAD REPLACEMENT PCCP      | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
27-0887958  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC       | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  | $    930,529.22 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 ROAD REPLACEMENT HMA       | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035114  | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC            | GARY          219-886-3728  | $  7,047,619.92 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035114  | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC            | GARY          219-886-3728  | $ 10,354,320.68 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BULB-T  | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035114  | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC            | GARY          219-886-3728  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 BR REPL WELDED PLATE GIRDER| IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035114  | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC            | GARY          219-886-3728  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 ROAD REPLACEMENT PCCP      | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035114  | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC            | GARY          219-886-3728  | $  1,006,368.66 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 ROAD REPLACEMENT HMA       | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT B -33357-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. N881008                                         DBE GOAL:  7.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT                                  ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  18,324,000.00 
CALL: 494                 ROUTE: 152                                                 LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 152 OVER CSX AND IHB RAILROAD, AT 0.4 MILE NORTH OF 
                                 SUMMER STREET 
                         COUNTY: LAKE 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID   TYPE LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1111003  | WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC                  | CLINTON       765-832-8526  | $  5,892,269.43 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1111003  | WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC                  | CLINTON       765-832-8526  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BULB-T  | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1111003  | WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC                  | CLINTON       765-832-8526  | $ 13,407,834.60 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 BR REPL WELDED PLATE GIRDER| IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1111003  | WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC                  | CLINTON       765-832-8526  | $  1,558,531.26 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 ROAD REPLACEMENT PCCP      | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1111003  | WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC                  | CLINTON       765-832-8526  | $  1,292,383.06 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 ROAD REPLACEMENT HMA       | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-1456400  | JAMES MCHUGH CONST CO & SUBS            | CHICAGO       312-986-8000  | $  7,311,087.12 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS               | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-1456400  | JAMES MCHUGH CONST CO & SUBS            | CHICAGO       312-986-8000  | $ 10,979,728.94 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BULB-T  | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-1456400  | JAMES MCHUGH CONST CO & SUBS            | CHICAGO       312-986-8000  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 BR REPL WELDED PLATE GIRDER| IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-1456400  | JAMES MCHUGH CONST CO & SUBS            | CHICAGO       312-986-8000  | $  1,186,642.74 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 ROAD REPLACEMENT PCCP      | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-1456400  | JAMES MCHUGH CONST CO & SUBS            | CHICAGO       312-986-8000  | $    965,069.21 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 ROAD REPLACEMENT HMA       | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT B -33357-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. N881008                                         DBE GOAL:  7.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT                                  ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  18,324,000.00 
CALL: 494                 ROUTE: 152                                                 LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 152 OVER CSX AND IHB RAILROAD, AT 0.4 MILE NORTH OF 
                                 SUMMER STREET 
                         COUNTY: LAKE 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID   TYPE LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3253376  | DUNNET BAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY         | GLENDALE HEIGHTS 630-539-12 | $  6,429,572.07 |R   |X  |    AWARD 
            | SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS               | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3253376  | DUNNET BAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY         | GLENDALE HEIGHTS 630-539-12 | $ 10,411,031.05 |R   |X  | 
            | SECTION 0002 BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BULB-T  | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3253376  | DUNNET BAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY         | GLENDALE HEIGHTS 630-539-12 |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 BR REPL WELDED PLATE GIRDER| IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3253376  | DUNNET BAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY         | GLENDALE HEIGHTS 630-539-12 | $  1,529,014.08 |R   |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 ROAD REPLACEMENT PCCP      | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3253376  | DUNNET BAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY         | GLENDALE HEIGHTS 630-539-12 | $  1,159,330.62 |R   |X  | 
            | SECTION 0005 ROAD REPLACEMENT HMA       | IL                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE 
OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE: 
SECTION 0001 AND SECTION 0002 AND SECTION 0004; OR 
SECTION 0A01 AND SECTION 0002 AND SECTION 0005; OR 
SECTION 0001 AND SECTION 0003 AND SECTION OOO4; OR 
SECTION 0001 AND SECTION OOO3 AND SECTION 0004. 
 
THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001  + SECTION 0002    + SECTION 0005  + PVFM 0005       
                                     = $6,429,572.07 + $10,411,031.05 + $1,159,330.62 + $190,806.41 = $18,190,740.15 
 
LOW BIDDER CONTRACT AMOUNT = $17,999,933.74 
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